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The following excerpt consists of some interesting observations pertinent 
to the abortion issue from the pen of Calvin Fields.  –Jerry F. Bassett 
  

OBSERVATIONS Re. THE ISSUE OF ABORTION 
 

Commenting on Psalms 139:7-16, especially on the term “made” (verse 
15, NKJV, et al) as defined by Biblesoft’s New Exhaustive Strong’s 
Numbers and Concordance with Expanded Greek-Hebrew Dictionary, 
Calvin Fields wrote, as follows… 
   The word “created” comes from a “primitive root; to erect, i.e., create… 
by implication to own.” Abortion is an act of destruction against what 
God, as the Creator of natural law “knit together.” The context clearly 
shows that from the ‘unformed body,” in its most elemental, constituent 
parts, to an adult person, God sees, through His omniscient power, the 
formation and development of life. By any reasonable criteria, 
conception brings and joins together all necessary genetic elements of 
life! Attachment of the fertilized egg to the uterine wall then turns the 
mother into a “life support system.” Abortion, which “disconnects” the 
life, is no different and no less wrong than “pulling the plug” on a 
comatose person who has every chance of full recovery. An act every 
court in America would consider premeditated murder. 
   How, then, can pregnant women, and support groups who approve and 
even encourage their abortive actions, justify their actions? Who gave 
them the right to consider that which God “created” and “owns” a 
disposable “fetus,” a thing of “choice”? No president, no governor, no 
legislature, no court “under God” has the authority to “approve” of this 
heinous defiance of His laws. Temporal gratification will mean nothing on 
the Day of Judgment (Mark 8:37).  
 
         For we must all appear before the judgment seat of Christ, that 
           each one may receive what is due him for the things done while in 
           the body, whether good or bad…” “It is mine to avenge; I will re- 
           pay” “…It is a dreadful thing to fall into the hands of the living God” 
          (2 Corinthians 5:10; Hebrews 10:30-31). 
  

                                                Calvin Fields, Things You Never Heard, Pg. 148 



 


